G\CMTE\NR\I\AEW\JR DUCK STAMP REAUTH. XML

1181H CONGRESS
18T SESSION H o R.

To reauthorize the Junior Duck Stamp Conservation and Design Program
Act of 1994 (16 U.S.C. 719 et seq.).

(Original Signature of Member)

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

M . introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on

A BILL

To reauthorize the Junior Duck Stamp Conservation and
Design Program Act of 1994 (16 U.S.C. 719 et seq.).

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. REAUTHORIZATION OF JUNIOR DUCK STAMP

CONSERVATION AND DESIGN PROGRAM ACT

2

3

4

5 OF 1994.
6 (a) DEFINITION OF STATE.—Section 5 of the Junior
7 Duck Stamp Conservation and Design Program Act of
8 1994 (16 U.S.C. 719b-1) is amended—

9

(1) by inserting “and” after “Guam,”’; and

g:\V\F\121123\F121123.013.xml (91360913)
December 11, 2023 (12:53 p.m.)



G\CMTE\NR\I\AEW\JR DUCK STAMP REAUTH. XML

O o0 N N W B W

N N T e T
whn A~ W D = O

g:\V\F\121123\F121123.013.xml
December 11, 2023 (12:53 p.m.)

(b) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

2

(2) by striking *‘, and any other territory or

possession’” after “Virgin Islands”.

Section

6 of the Junior Duck Stamp Conservation and Design

Program Act of 1994 (16 U.S.C. 719¢) is amended—

(1) 1 subsection (a)—

(A) by striking “$350,000” and inserting
“$550,000”; and

(B) by striking “2006 through 2010” and
inserting 2024 through 2030"; and
(2) in subsection (b)—

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking
“$100,000” and inserting “$200,000”; and

(B) in paragraph (2), by striking
“$250,000” and inserting “$350,000".

(91360913)




  
    G:\CMTE\NR\18\AEW\JR DUCK STAMP REAUTH.XML XXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXX 12/11/2023 12:53 XXXXXXXXX 12/08/2023 10:02 AM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXX   913609|3  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
    
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 118th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
 M_. ______ introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To reauthorize the Junior Duck Stamp Conservation and Design Program Act of 1994 (16 U.S.C. 719 et seq.). 
 
  
  1. Reauthorization of Junior Duck Stamp Conservation and Design Program Act of 1994 
  (a) Definition of State Section 5 of the Junior Duck Stamp Conservation and Design Program Act of 1994 (16 U.S.C. 719b–1) is amended— 
  (1) by inserting  and after  Guam,; and 
  (2) by striking  , and any other territory or possession after  Virgin Islands.   
  (b) Authorization of appropriations Section 6 of the Junior Duck Stamp Conservation and Design Program Act of 1994 (16 U.S.C. 719c) is amended— 
  (1) in subsection (a)— 
  (A) by striking  $350,000 and inserting  $550,000; and 
  (B) by striking  2006 through 2010 and inserting  2024 through 2030; and 
  (2) in subsection (b)— 
  (A) in paragraph (1), by striking  $100,000 and inserting  $200,000; and 
  (B) in paragraph (2), by striking  $250,000 and inserting  $350,000.   
 


